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Crosswalk End of Program SLOs and Role Specific Nursing Competencies 

End of Program SLO Role Specific Nursing Competencies AACN Essential Domain 
1. Use science-based theories and concepts 
and national practice guidelines and 
standards to provide high-quality health 
care. 

Synthesize knowledge from nursing and 
other disciplines to inform education, 
practice, and research.(1.2f) 

Domain 1: Knowledge for Nursing Practice 
Competency 

2. Lead change and promote innovation in 
organizational and health systems for 
quality improvement. 

Use national safety resources to lead team-
based change initiatives. (5.1l) 

Domain 5: Quality and Safety 

3. Apply clinical scholarship in the 
generation, application and dissemination 
of research findings to support evidence-
based practice. 

Apply and critically evaluate advanced 
knowledge in a defined area of nursing 
practice. (4.1h) 

Domain 4: Scholarship for Nursing 
Discipline  

4. Use information technology to improve 
and transform health care. 

Generate information and knowledge from 
health information technology databases. 
(8.2f) 

Domain 8: Informatics and Healthcare 
Technologies 

5. Develop and implement health care 
policies for advocacy in health care. 

Design system improvement strategies 
based on performance data and metrics. 
(7.3f) 

Domain 7: Systems-Based Practice  

6. Demonstrate leadership and 
interprofessional collaboration to improve 
nursing practice and patient outcomes. 

Foster an environment that supports the 
constructive sharing of multiple 
perspectives and enhances interprofessional 
learning guided by leadership principles and 
theories. (6.4f, 10.3k) 

Domain 6: Interprofessional Partnerships 
Domain 10: Personal, Professional, and 
Leadership Development 

7. Utilize the advanced nursing practice 
knowledge for clinical prevention and 
population health to improve the Nation’s 
health. 

Use established or evolving methods to 
determine population-focused priorities for 
care. (3.1l) 

Domain 3: Population Health 
 

8. Demonstrate advanced levels of clinical 
judgment, systems thinking, and 
accountability in the delivery of health care. 

Employ context driven, advanced reasoning 
to the diagnostic and decision-making 
process. (2.4f) 

Domain 2: Person-Centered Care 
Domain 9: Professionalism 
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